Eliot Bernstein

From: Candy <tourcandy@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, December 13, 2018 1:18 PM

To: Eliot I. Bernstein

Subject: Fwd: Gables Town Place

Attachments: image014.jpg; Untitled attachment 00527.html; image015.jpg; Untitled attachment 00530.html;

image016.jpg; Untitled attachment 00533.html; image017.jpg; Untitled attachment 00536.html;
image018,jpg; Untitled attachment 00539.html; image019,jpg; Untitled attachment 00542.html;
image013.jpg; Untitled attachment 00545.html; One Bedroom.zip; Untitled attachment 00548.html

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Sylvia Pierantoni <SPierantoni@gables.com>
Date: December 13, 2018 at 12:47:54 PM EST

To: "tourcandy@gmail.com" <tourcandy@gmail.com>
Subject: Gables Town Place

Hi,

Attached are pictures of our 1 bedrooms. (They actually mostly have the dark wood cabinets not white
in the kitchen). Also what is required and due each month—

Due to Apply—
e 585 application per person
e  S$485 administration one time
Due to create Lease—
e  S400 security deposit with approved credit ( half a month - one month rent if conditional)
e Internationally is 1 month rent security deposit
Due at Move in—
e 1% month’s rent including water/sewer/trash

Let me know if you have any other questions.

For January 1%, | have APT 2211 second floor, vaulted ceilings, $1340 + $47 (water/sewer/trash/pest)=
$1352/month.

Additionally renter’s insurance is needed $95.00/year or $8.72/month.
Also Electric the FPL.

-Sylvia

Sylvia Pierantoni | Leasing Professional

Gables Town Place | Taking Care of the Way You Live™



21409 Town Lakes Dr. | Boca Raton, FL 33486
0:561.338.6861 | f: 561.394.6718

spierantoni@gables.com | www.gables.com/townplace




