IN THE CIRCUIT COURT IN AND FOR THE 15^{TH} JUDICIAL CIRCUIT IN AND FOR PALM BEACH COUNTY, FLORIDA

IN RE: ESTATE OF:		PROBATE DIVISION
SIMON L. BERNSTEIN,		FILE NO: 502012CP4391XXXXNB IH
Deceased.		
	/	

PETITION FOR ORDER AUTHORIZING PAYMENT
OF ATTORNEY'S FEES AND EXPENSES FOR THE PERSONAL REPRESENTATIVE OF
THE ESTATE OF SIMON L. BERNSTEIN
FOR MARCH 24, 2015 THROUGH APRIL 24, 2015

Petitioner, BRIAN M. O'CONNELL, as Personal Representative of the Estate of Simon L. Bernstein and the attorney for the Personal Representative (collectively "Personal Representative"), alleges:

- 1. The Personal Representative is an attorney engaged in the practice of law in the State of Florida and is a partner with the law firm of Ciklin Lubitz & O'Connell.
- 2. On July 24, 2014, he was appointed as the Successor Personal Representative of the Estate of Simon L. Bernstein.
- 3. The Personal Representative has rendered services and incurred expenses for the benefit of the Estate, from March 24, 2015 to April 24, 2015, as more fully described and set forth in the itemized schedule of services and expenses attached hereto as Exhibit A, for which the Personal Representative has not been paid.
- 4. The Personal Representative's records indicate that during the period of time above 58.60 attorney hours and 45.10 paralegal hours have been expended as set forth in the itemized summary of services and expenses attached hereto as Exhibit "A".
- 5. The Personal Representative believes that a reasonable fee for the services performed during that period of time is \$19,914.00 and costs of \$3,792.18 totaling \$23,706.18.

In Re: Estate of Simon L. Bernstein File No: 502012CP4391XXXXNB IH

6. The Personal Representative fees and costs described on the attached Exhibit "A" were incurred in discharging administration responsibilities, as more particularly described in Exhibit "A".

WHEREFORE, BRIAN M. O'CONNELL, as Personal Representative of the Estate of SIMON L. BERNSTEIN and the attorney for the Personal Representative, requests this Court award the Personal Representative a reasonable fee for his services and expenses incurred, and authorizing the payment of such fees and expenses from the assets of the estate.

Under penalties of perjury, I declare that I have read the foregoing, and the facts alleged are true, to the best of my knowledge and belief.

Dated August 2, 20

BRIAN M. O'CONNELL

Florida Bar No. 308471

ASHLEY CRISPIN ACKAL

Florida Bar No. 37495

JOIELLE A. FOGLIETTA

Florida Bar No. 94238

ZACHARY M. ROTHMAN

Florida Bar No. 117924

CIKLIN LUBITZ & O'CONNELL

515 N. Flagler Dr., 20th Floor

West Palm Beach, FL 33401

Telephone: 561-832-5900 Facsimile: 561-833-4209

primary e-mail: service@ciklinlubitz.com

secondary e-mail: probateservice@ciklinlubitz.com

In Re: Estate of Simon L. Bernstein File No: 502012CP4391XXXXNB IH

I HEREBY CERTIFY that a true and correct of the foregoing was sent by e-mail service

or U.S. Postal Service on the and day of

August, 2016 to the parties on the

attached Service List.

BRIAN M. O'CONNELL Florida Bar No: 308471 ASHLEY CRISPIN ACKAL Florida Bar No: 37495 JOIELLE A. FOGLIETTA Florida Bar No. 94238 ZACHARY M. ROTHMAN Florida Bar No. 117924

CIKLIN LUBITZ & O'CONNELL 515 N. Flagler Dr., 20th Floor West Palm Beach, FL 33401

Telephone: 561-832-5900 Facsimile: 561-833-4209

primary e-mail: service@ciklinlubitz.com

secondary e-mail: probateservice@ciklinlubitz.com

In Re: Estate of Simon L. Bernstein File No: 502012CP4391XXXXNB IH

SERVICE LIST

Alan B. Rose, Esq. Page, Mrachek, Fitzgerald & Rose, PA. 505 S. Flagler Dr., Suite 600 West Palm Beach, FL 33401 (561) 355-6991 arose@mrachek-law.com mchandler@mrachek-law.com Attorney for Ted S. Bernstein	John P. Morrissey, Esq. 330 Clematis St., Suite 213 West Palm Beach, FL 33401 john@jmorrisseylaw.com Attorney for Molly Simon et al	Donald R. Tescher, Esq. Robert L. Spallina, Esq. 925 S. Federal Highway, Suite 500 Boca Raton, FL 33432 Dtescher@tescherlaw.com ddustin@tescherlaw.com rspallina@tescherspallina.com kmoran@tescherspallina.com
Peter Feaman, Esq. Peter M. Feaman, P.A. 3695 Boynton Beach Blvd.,Suite 9 Boynton Beach, FL 33436 pfeaman@feamanlaw.com	Shendell & Pollock, P.L. 2700 N. Military Trail, suite 150 Boca Raton, FL 33431 241-2323 Fax: 241-2330 Gary R. Shendell, Esq. gary@shendellpollock.com estella@shendellpollock.com grs@shendellpollock.com Kenneth S. Pollock, Esq. ken@shendellpollock.com britt@shendellpollock.com grs@shendellpollock.com Matthew A. Tornincasa, Esq. matt@shendellpollock.com robyne@shendellpollock.com grs@shendellpollock.com Attorney for Tescher and	Max Friedstein 2142 Churchill Lane Highland Park, IL 60035 Beneficiary
Eliot Bernstein and Joshua, Jacob and Daniel Bernstein, Minors c/o Eliot and Candice Bernstein, Parents and Natural Guardians 2753 N.W. 34 th St. Boca Raton, FL 33434 iviewit@iviewit.tv Jill lantoni and Julia lantoni, a Minor c/o Guy and Jill lantoni, her Parents & Natural Guardians 2101 Magnolia Lane Highland Park, IL 60035 iilliantoni@gmail.com	Pamela Beth Simon 950 N. Michigan Ave., Apt. 2603 Chicago, IL 60611 psimon@stpcorp.com	Lisa Friedstein and Carley Friedstein, Minor c/o Jeffrey and Lisa Friedstein Parent and Natural Guardian 2142 Churchill Lane Highland Park, IL 60035 Lisa@friedsteins.com Lisa.friedstein@gmail.com Beneficiary

Ciklin Lubitz & O'Connell 515 North Flagler Drive, 20th Floor West Palm Beach, FL 33401 561-832-5900 Federal ID #59-2523541

Brian M. O'Connell, Esq. c/o BMO

June 10, 2016 Bill Number 299393 File Number 11270-52860

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Re: Bernstein, Simon L. Estate

LEGAL SERVICES

Through April 24, 2015

_	,		
<u>Date</u> 03/24/15	<u>Atty</u> BMO	<u>Description</u> Strategy conference with ANC and JAF re:	<u>Time</u> 0.40
03/24/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of Feaman 3/24/15 Notice of Unavailability.	0.10
03/24/15	ANG	Strategy conference with BMO and JAF re:	0.40
03/24/15	SHM	Calls with Hall & Hall and with Hittle appraisers. Confernce with JAF - arranging for re-appraisal of TPP (.6) Calls with various movers / storage for cost. (2.0) Receipt of various motions & notices. Prepare for hearing. (.8)	3.40
03/24/15	SHM	Finalize P/Sell TTP and N/Hearing - file/serve (.4). Draft proposed Orders for hearing (.6). Prepare for hearing (.5)	1.50
03/24/15	SHM	Additional prep with JAF for hearing	0.50
			HIBIT
			9 "
			

03/24/15	JAF	Revisions to motion for inspection, appraisal, storage of TPP (.4); Instructions to SHM re: prep for hearing on same, appraisers and storage of property (1.0); Addressed issues re: same (1.8); Conference with Peter Feaman re: TPP (.2); Conference with Elliot re: same and additional TPP of decedent (.5); Correspondence with and instructions from BMO rE: same (.4); Additional revisions to motion for PP based on additional property (.2); Revisions to order on same (.7).	5.20
03/24/15	JAF	Conference with Alan Rose re; sale of Shirley house and TPP.	0.30
03/24/15	JAF	Strategy conference with BMO and ANC re:	0.90
03/25/15	вмо	issues re: (.5). Receipt and review of Rose 3/25/15 Notice of	0.10
		Special Set Hearing for 3/26/15.	0.10
03/25/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of Tescher 3/25/15 Notice of Unavailability.	0.10
03/25/15	ANĢ	Instructions to JAF post-UMC hearing.	0.30
03/25/15	SHM	Calls to confirm appraisal and packing people	0.40
03/25/15	JAF	Prepared for and attended hearing on appraisal, inspection moving and storage or TPP in decedent's home and in office; post-hearing conference with Elliot; post-heraing conference with Alan Rose; pre-hearing conference with Alan Rose; prepared memo to BMO re: same; instructions to SHM re: same (2.2); Instructions to SHM re: inspection and appraisal (.5).	2.70
03/25/15	JAF	Consideration issues raised by Elliot re: PP in Sheriff's reports (.3); Revisions to pet for auth to pay accountants (.4); Memo to BMO re: (.1); Instructions to SHM re: jewelry (.1); Conference with CJT re: fee petition (.1).	1.00

03/25/15	CJT	Conference with JAF re: preparation of Petition for Attorneys Fees and Costs.	0.10
03/26/15	ANG	Instructions to JAF re: inspection.	0.10
03/26/15	SHM	Calls with packers and appraiser re: confirming appointment for appraisal (.5). Revisions to order from hearing. Draft letter to Judge Colin. Arrange for hand delivery of proposed order. (1.0)	1.50
03/26/15	JAF	Revisions to amended order on pet re: PP (.3); Prepared for inspection appraisal and moving of TPP; instructions to SHM re: same (1.1); Prepared for and attended hearing on personal property inspection and sale of house; post-hearing conference with Elliot re: concerns about additional TPP (2.3); Instructions to SHM re: amended order on PP (.2); Addressed issues re: same (.2); Memo to BMO re: RTP (.2).	4.30
03/26/15	JAF	Instructions from ANC re: inspection.	0.10
03/26/15	CJT	Prepare Petition for Attorneys Fees and Expenses and proposed Order; Ensure account is up to date.	1.30
03/26/15	CJT	Instructions from JAF Re: inspection; Tephone call with JAF re: appraisal and inspection;	0.60
03/27/15	SHM	Calls with JAF and movers re: appraisal. (.2) Conference with CT re: appaisal and court order.(.5) Prep for 3/31 hearing. (1.0) Call with JP Morgan confirming name change on accounts to BMO. Receipt of e-mail and further action necessary. (.5)	3.00
03/27/15	JAF	Correspondence with Alan Rose re: inspection and appraisal of TPP (.2); Phone conferences (x2) with Alan Rose re: same (.3); Instructions to CJT re: same (.3); Instructions to SHM re: same (.2); Prepared for and attended inspection and appraisal; conference with appraiser (4.8, plus .5 NO Charge); Conference with RBC re tax returns (.3).	6.10

03/27/15	CJT	Instructions from JAF Re: location of inspection; Receipt and review of e-mail re: appraisal at Boca Raton residence; Inspect TPP at residence.	7.30
03/30/15	ВМО	Conference with ANC to prepare for 3/31 hearing.	0.30
03/30/15	вмо	Additional hearing preparation.	0.80
03/30/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of 3/30/15 e-correspondence from Alan Rose with attached Accounting of Simon Bernstein Trust through 3/15/15.	0.30
03/30/15	вмо	Receipt and review of 3/30/15 e-correspondence from Alan Rose with attached transcript excerpt.	0.40
03/30/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of 3/30/15 e-correspondence from Alan Rose with attached slightly revised order on successor trustee's motion to approve sale of trust property, etc.	0.10
03/30/15	ANG	Preparation for 3/31/ hearing with BMO.	0.30
03/30/15	JAF	Attend continuation of inspection and appraisal, instructions to CJT re: contents of condo and inspection of same; addressed issues re: same (1.4, plus .6 NO Charge); Instructions to SHM re: prep for eliot stmt of claim hearing; research re: same (.8).	2.20
03/30/15	JAF	Conference with Eliot Bernstein re: TPP and sheriff's report.	0.30
03/30/15	CJT	Complete inspection of Tangible Personal Property.	8.70
03/31/15	вмо	Prepare for and attend Evidenciary Hearing.	3.10
03/31/15	ВМО	Call to Peter Feaman re: settlement with Stansbury.	0.20
03/31/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of Rose 3/31/15 e-correspondence to Peter Feaman re: Stansbury claim.	0.10
03/31/15	вмо	Receipt and review of Successor Trustee's Notice of Accounting of the Simon Bernstein Revocable Trust from 2/3/14 through 3/15/15.	0.10
03/31/15	вмо	Instructions to JAF.	0.10

03/31/15	вмо	Conference with ANC re:	0.30
03/31/15	ANG	Conference with BMO re:	0.30
03/31/15	SHM	Preparation for 4/2 hearing	1.00
03/31/15	JAF	Prepared memo to BMO re: (.2); Instructions to SHM re: (.2); Review and analysis of complaint, mot for accting and pet to remove Ted in prep for hearing (.6); Review and analysis of jewelry insurance report and sheriff's report re: same (.3).	1.30
04/01/15	вмо	Receipt and review of 3/26/15 e-correspondence from Rose re: Sahm Mortgage.	0.10
04/01/15	ВМО	Review and revise proposed Order on PR's Petition for Instructions, etc. Review and revise Order on PR's Petition for Instructions, etc.	0.20
04/01/15	SHM	Draft proposed order from 4/1/15 hearing. Revision (.7). Draft orders specially setting hearing for 4/28/15 - e-mail exchanges with D. Garten re: form of order (.8). Preparation for hearing in trust matter on 4/2 for numerous motions (2.0)	3.50
04/01/15	SHM	Make additional changes to proposed O/PR's P/Instructions	0.20
04/01/15	JAF	Prep for hearing on Ted removal; instructions to SHM re: same; instructions to SHM re: orders.	2.10
04/02/15	вмо	Receipt and review of Rose 4/2/15 letter to Judge Colin with attached proposed Order on Trustee's Motion to Dismiss Eliot's Complaint, etc.	0.10
04/02/15	вмо	Receipt and review of Rose 4/2/15 Notice of Special Set Hearing for 4/23/15.	0.20
04/02/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of Morrissey 4/2/15 e-correspondence.	0.10

04/02/15	вмо	Receipt and review of Rose 4/2/15 e-correspondence to Morrissey and BMO.	0.10
04/02/15	вмо	Receipt and review of CJT status memo on Gilbert Hall appraisal.	0.10
04/02/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of JAF 4/2/15 memo; instructions to JAF re: same.	0.10
04/02/15	вмо	Receipt and review of 3/30/15 Amended Order on Petition to Take Possession, Store, Inspect and Appraise Tangible Personal Property.	0.10
04/02/15	SHM	Calls with White Lion Moving & Storage re: estimates to move and store TTP (several)	0.50
04/02/15	SHM	E-mail communication with Eliot Bernstein	0.10
04/02/15	JAF	Finished review of pertinent documents in prep for hearing.	0.40
04/02/15	JAF	Continued prep for motion to dismiss ted removal hearing (.9); Review of prelim inspection report (.2).	1.10
04/02/15	CJT	Telephone call with Gilbert Hall regarding appraisal; Prepare e-mail to Attys; Prepare Appraisal with notations from inspection for Atty review.	0.80
04/03/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of Rose 4/3/15 e-correspondence to JAF.	0.10
04/03/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of Rose 4/3/15 e-correspondence to BMO, David Simon and Adam Simon.	0.10
04/03/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of rose 4/3/15 confidential e-correspondence to BMO re: settlement of litigation.	0.10
04/03/15	вмо	Telephone call with Jim Stamos re: Illinois litigation.	0.30
04/03/15	JAF	Correspondence with Alan Rose (.1, plus .2 NO Charge); Reviewed quote for moving and storage of TPP; addressed issues re: same (.2, plus .2 NO Charge); INstructions from BMO re: petition to sell personal property and IRA information (.2).	0.50
04/06/15	вмо	Receipt and review of 4/4/15 e-correspondence x2 from Eliot Bernstein and Kevin Horan.	0.10

04/06/15	JAF	Correspondence with Candice Bernstein re: appraisal (.1); Prepared memo to MDL re:	0.90
		(.4); Addressed issues re:	
		(.4); Reviewed correspondence from Alan Rose (.2- NO Charge).	
04/06/15	MDL	Draft Petition for Authority re: sale of TPP (1.5); Complete IRS Form 4506 (x2) (.5)	2.00
04/06/15	CJT	Review fee statement; Revise Petition and proposed Order; Telephone call to appraiser regarding report; Prepare e-mail to appraiser.	1.00
04/07/15	вмо	Receipt and review of 4/7/15 correspondence from James Stamos.	0.10
04/07/15	ANG	Strategy conference with JAF re:	0.70
04/07/15	JAF	Memo to MDL re: IRA information needed and documentation (.4); Revisions to letter to JP Morgan re: request for IRA documentation (.2); Strategy conference with ANC re:	2.10
	7	(.7); Conference with MDL re: beneficiary information in IRA (.2); Analysis of documents re: same (.4, plus .2 NO Charge); Memo to MDL re: disposition of TPP (.2).	
04/07/15	MDL	Telephone Conference with John Hopkins (JPMorgan)(.3); Draft Correspondence to JPMorgam (.3); Receive correspondence from JPMorgan (.1): Review documents provided by JPMorgan and various IRA account documents (.5)	1.20
04/07/15	MDL	Review and Analyze Will and Trust re: disposition of TPP	0.50
04/08/15	SHM	E-mail instructions from MDL re: finalizing letter to JP Morgan. Review docs received from JP Morgan IRA. Finalize transmittal of IRS request for back tax returns.	0.80

04/08/15	JAF	Review of multiple emails from Eliot re: information on decedent's assets; consideration of RFA and interrogatories needed (.4); Conference with MDL re: RTP and additional information to add to same (.4).	0.80
04/09/15	вмо	Receipt and review of requests for tax returns.	0.20
04/09/15	вмо	Review and revise Hawkins letter re: IRA.	0.10
04/10/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of 4/10/15 e-correspondence from Eliot Bernstein.	0.10
04/10/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of JAF 4/10/15 e-correspondence to Eliot Bernstein.	0.10
04/10/15	JAF	Memo to BMO re: (.2); Review of information from Elliot re: veba, insurance policies, etc. and memo to MDL re: RTP updates (.5).	0.70
04/10/15	MDL	Draft request for production to Elliot, Intiial PRs and Draft RFA and Rogs to Simon's children and Elliot's children	1.80
04/10/15	CJT	Instruction from JAF; Telephone call with Appraiser; E-mail update.	0.30
04/13/15	вмо	Receipt and review of 4/7/14 Order Permitting Trustee to File Motion to Hold Eliot Bernstein in Contempt of Court and for Sanctions.	0.10
04/13/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of 4/14/15 e-correspondence from James Stamos, and JAF response to same.	0.10
04/13/15	вмо	Receipt and review of 4/13/15 e-correspondence from Morrissey, and JAF 4/14/15 memo concerning same.	0.10
04/14/15	JAF	Addressed issues re: (.3); Correspondence	0.40
		with Stamos re: (.1).	
04/15/15	вмо	Receipt and review of Motion to Stop Sale of 7020 Lions Head Lane Property filed by Eliot 4/15/15.	0.30
04/15/15	CJT	Telephone call to appraiser regarding status on report.	0.10

04/16/15	вмо	Receipt and review of Feaman 4/16/15 correspondence to BMO.	0.10
04/16/15	вмо	Receipt and review of Rose 4/16/15 Supplement to Motion to Approve Sale of Trust Property Re: Closing and Title Issues for Shirley's Homestead.	0.10
04/16/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of 4/16/15 e-correspondence from Stamos.	0.10
04/16/15	JAF	Review of email from Stamos re: addressed issues re:	0.10
04/16/15	CJT	Telephone message from appraiser; Return call.	0.10
04/17/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of Rose 4/17/15 Supplemental Notice of Special Set Hearing for 4/23/15.	0.10
04/17/15	JAF	Conference with Alan Rose re: personal property, appraisal, sale of house (.3); Addressed issues re: same (.1); Conference with Kevin Moran re: (.2).	0.60
04/20/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of 4/18/15 e-correspondence from Eliot Bernstein to Alan Rose.	0.10
04/20/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of 4/19/15 e-correspondence from Eliot Bernstein to BMO and JAF.	0.10
04/20/15	JAF	Addressed issues re: request for tax returns (.2); Reviewed email from Eliot Bernstein (.1).	0.30
04/21/15	вмо	Receipt and review of JAF 4/21/15 memo.	0.10
04/21/15	SHM	Add'l hearing prep. Call to A. Rose's ofc for motion to be heard	0.70
04/21/15	JAF	Conference with Alan Rose re: Eliot stmt of claim and objection (.1); Addressed issues re: same (.2, plus .1 NO Charge); Memo to BMO re: same (.1, plus .1 NO Charge); Instructions to CJT re: appraisal (.2).	0.60
04/21/15	MDL	Draft of Discovery to Eilliot and siblings (.5)	0.50
04/21/15	CJT	Receipt and review of appraisal report; compare with notes; Conference with JAF.	1.00

04/22/15	вмо	Conference with JAF re:	0.30
04/22/15	вмо	Receipt and review of Eliot 4/22/15 email with attached 4/21/15 correspondence from Alan Rose.	0.10
04/22/15	вмо	Instructions to JAF.	0.10
04/22/15	вмо	Receipt and review of JAF 4/22/15 memo.	0.10
04/22/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of SHM 4/22/15 correspondence to Alan Rose.	0.10
04/22/15	SHM	Communication with JAF re: hearing prep for 4/23 and e-mail from E. Bernstein	0.40
04/22/15	SHM	E-mail with A. Rose re: clarification of matters to be heard. Finalize preparation of documents for hearing. Review Supplemental N/Hearing and update with added motion and referenced cases.	3.00
04/22/15	JAF	Instructions from BMO re: ; addressed issues re: same; instructions to SHM re: same (1.2); Conference with BMO re: (.3); Correspondence with Illinois attorney (.1).	1.60
04/22/15	CJT	Telephone call with appraiser to discuss report;	1.30
04/23/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of JAF 4/23/15 memo with attached email from Eliot Bernstein.	0.10
04/23/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of 4/23/15 e-correspondence from Kevin Horan, Esq.	0.10
04/23/15	вмо	Receipt and review of JAF 4/23/15 e-correspondence to Peter Feaman, Esq.	0.10
04/23/15	JAF	Correspondence with Illinois counsel re: addressed issues re: 1 NO Charge).	0.20
04/24/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of 4/24/15 letter and invoice from Stamos & Trucco, LLP.	0.10
04/24/15	ВМО	Receipt and review of Objection to Statement of Claim by Eliot signed by Alexandra Bernstein, Eric Bernstein, Molly Simon, Michael Bernstein, filed 4/24/15 by Morrissey.	0.10

Brian M. O'Connell, Esq.				
04/24/15	вмо	Receipt and review of 4/24/15 email communications (11), Alan Rose, Feaman's office, JAF, SHM; prepare memos (x8) to JAF, SHM.	0.30	
04/24/15	ANG	Conference with JAF re:	0.20	
04/24/15	DAR	Assist CJT with return of service to Objections to Statements of Claim.	0.40	
04/24/15	JAF	Instructions from BMO re: plus .1 NO Charge); Reviewed and revised same (.4); Conference with and instructions to SHM re: (.2); Conference with ANC re: (.2); Instructions to CJT re: (.1); Email to Morrissey re: same (.1- NO Charge); Review and revised fee petition; instructions to CJT re: same (.2).	1.30	
04/24/15	JAF	Revisions to pet to move, store and sell TPP (.5, plus .1 NO Charge).	0.50	
04/24/15	CJT	Review Appraisal Report; E-mail Appraiser; Telephone call with Appraiser; Instruction from JAF; Revise Objections to Claims; E-File Objections to Claims.	1.60	

TOTAL LEGAL SERVICES:

\$19,914.00

LEGAL SERVICES SUMMARY

ASHLEY CRIPSIN ACKAL	2.30 Hrs	\$295/Hr	\$678.50
BRIAN M O'CONNELL	11.70 Hrs	\$350/Hr	\$4,095.00
CYNTHIA J THOMAS	24.20 Hrs	\$125/Hr	\$3,025.00
DIANNE A REED	0.40 Hrs	\$125/Hr	\$50.00
JOY A FOGLIETTA	38.60 Hrs	\$205/Hr	\$7,913.00
MELISSA D LAZARCHICK	6.00 Hrs	\$265/Hr	\$1,590.00
SHERRI H MCDOWELL	20.50 Hrs	\$125/Hr	\$2,562.50
	103.70 Hrs		\$19,914.00

COSTS ADVANCED

Through April 24, 2015

Copy/Printing Expense

04/24/15 Copy/Printing Expense

317.70

Total Copy/Printing Expense

317.70

Long Distance Tel 04/24/15	lephone Long Distance Telephone	27.28	
	Total Long Distance Teleph	· -	27.28
Court Reporter Co			
04/15/15	Pleasanton, Greenhill, Meek & Marsaa	155.00	
04/15/15	Pleasanton, Greenhill, Meek & Marsaa	210.00	
	Total Court Reporter Costs		365.00
Mileage/Tolls/Taxi			
04/02/15	Michael A. Nixon; Mileage	0.58	
04/02/15	Cynthia J. Thomas; Mileage	64.40	
	Total Mileage/Tolls/Taxi		64.98
Other Cash Costs			
03/25/15	Richard B. Crum, CPA - (2013)	2,850.00	
03/31/15	Joy Foglietta - reimb office depot/office max	12.22	
04/06/15	Internal Revenue Service - Individual 1041	150.00	
	Total Other Cash Costs		3,012.22
Fax			,
04/24/15	Fax	5.00	
	Total Fax		5.00
	TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED:		\$3,792.18
	TOTAL THIS BILL	\$	23,706.18