

VIEWIT DOES NOT ATTEST TO THE AUTHENTICITY OF THESE BILLING RECORDS AND CITES THEM AS FRAUDULENT

CLIENT: IVIEWIT CORPORATION
MATTER: GENERAL CORPORATE ADVICE
PAGE: 3

THIS COMPANY DOES
NOT EXIST

June 18, 1999

01/27/99 L GARDNER .25 Ltr to client re: articles of incorporation.

01/27/99 M ROBBINS 1.75 Preparation of correspondence to Bernstein.
Review corporate formation documents from
Secretary of State. Telephone conference with
Bernstein. Preparation of memorandum to
Wheeler re: intellectual property matters.

01/28/99 A GORTZ .75 Ken Rubenstein call, cf call Eliot Bernstein &
Ken Rubenstein, cf Mara Robbins re
confidentiality agreement

01/28/99 L GARDNER .25 Order minute book for Iviewit, Inc.

01/29/99 G COLEMAN 1.25 Preparation of confidentiality agreement.

02/01/99 A GORTZ .25 Rev. confidentiality agmt, MR call

02/01/99 C WHEELER .25 Conf as to status of intellectual property work

02/16/99 A GORTZ .25 Gerry Lewin call, cf CCW

02/16/99 R ROWE .25 Tel. GC re finder/BD issue

02/16/99 D THOMPSON II .50 Conference with Attorney Gayle Coleman re
Financial Advisor Agreement.

02/16/99 C WHEELER .25 Conf with Mr. Bernstein; call to Mr. Rubenstein

02/16/99 G COLEMAN 1.75 Study and revise proposed financial consulting
agreement. Telephone conferences with I.
Newman. Research re: advisory compensation.

02/17/99 R ROWE .25 Tel. GC re finders/BD issue; Tel. CW, GC re
finder issue

02/17/99 C WHEELER .25 Call to Mr. Rubenstein re patent advice; call
with Ms. Coleman re financial advisor

02/17/99 C WHEELER 1.00 Conf as to broker dealer situation; call to Mr.
Rowe; call to Mr. Bernstein

02/17/99 G COLEMAN 2.25 Preparation of detailed correspondence.
Telephone conferences with I. Newman.
Preparation of proposed revisions to financing
agreement. Telephone conference with R. Rowe.
Telephone conference with C. Wheeler and R.
Rowe.

02/18/99 C WHEELER 1.50 Conf with Mr. Lewin; follow up on Corp.; follow
up on copyright; follow up on


VIEWIT DOES NOT ATTEST TO THE AUTHENTICITY OF THESE BILLING RECORDS AND CITES THEM AS FRAUDULENT

CLIENT: IVIEWIT CORPORATION
MATTER: GENERAL CORPORATE ADVICE
PAGE: 3

June 18, 1999

01/27/99 L GARDNER .25 Ltr to client re: articles of incorporation.

01/27/99 M ROBBINS 1.75 Preparation of correspondence to Bernstein.
Review corporate formation documents from
Secretary of State. Telephone conference with
Bernstein. Preparation of memorandum to
Wheeler re: intellectual property matters.

01/28/99 A GORTZ .75 Ken Rubenstein call, cf call Eliot Bernstein &
 Ken Rubenstein, cf Mara Robbins re
confidentiality agreement

01/28/99 L GARDNER .25 Order minute book for Iviewit, Inc.


01/29/99 G COLEMAN 1.25 Preparation of confidentiality agreement.

02/01/99 A GORTZ .25 Rev. confidentiality agmt, MR call

02/01/99 C WHEELER .25 Conf as to status of intellectual property work


02/16/99 A GORTZ .25 Gerry Lewin call, cf CCW

02/16/99 R ROWE .25 Tel. GC re finder/BD issue

02/16/99 D THOMPSON II .50 Conference with Attorney Gayle Coleman re
Financial Advisor Agreement. 

02/16/99 C WHEELER .25 Conf with Mr. Bernstein; call to Mr. Rubenstein

02/16/99 G COLEMAN 1.75 Study and revise proposed financial consulting
agreement. Telephone conferences with I.
Newman. Research re: advisory compensation.

02/17/99 R ROWE .25 Tel. GC re finders/BD issue; Tel. CW, GC re
finder issue 

02/17/99 C WHEELER .25 Call to Mr. Rubenstein re patent advice; call
with Ms. Coleman re financial advisor

02/17/99 C WHEELER 1.00 Conf as to broker dealer situation; call to Mr.
Rowe; call to Mr. Bernstein

02/17/99 G COLEMAN 2.25 Preparation of detailed correspondence.
Telephone conferences with I. Newman.
Preparation of proposed revisions to financing
agreement. Telephone conference with R. Rowe.
Telephone conference with C. Wheeler and R.
Rowe.

02/18/99 C WHEELER 1.50 Conf with Mr. Lewin; follow up on Corp.; follow
up on copyright; follow up on

VIEWIT DOES NOT ATTEST TO THE AUTHENTICITY OF THESE BILLING RECORDS AND CITES THEM AS FRAUDULENT

CLIENT: IVIEWIT CORPORATION
MATTER: GENERAL CORPORATE ADVICE
PAGE: 4

June 18, 1999

02/18/99 C WHEELER .25 Conf with Mr. Rubenstein

02/18/99 L GARDNER .50 Prepare fictitious name application.

02/18/99 M ROBBINS 2.50 Inter-office conference with Wheeler re: intellectual property matters, organizational matters. Revisions to Bylaws, Organizational Minutes. Inter-office conferences with Gardner re: employer identification number, minute book. Draft and preparation of correspondence to Bernstein re: copyright and trademark searches, fees and costs. Review memorandum for Wheeler re: organizational matters.

02/18/99 G COLEMAN 2.50 Preparation of revisions to Jenex agreement. Telephone conferences with E. Bernstein. Study and revise website information and agreement.

02/19/99 L GARDNER .50 Prepare SS-4 application.

02/19/99 M ROBBINS 2.00 Telephone conferences with E. Bernstein, S. Bernstein. Revisions to Organizational Minutes. Review Fictitious Name Application, Employer Identification Application. Organization of file. Preparation of e-mail to Wheeler re: organizational matters. Draft and preparation of correspondence to E. Bernstein.

02/22/99 L GARDNER .75 Revise application; prepare stock certificates.

02/22/99 M ROBBINS 1.50 Draft and preparation of correspondence to Bernstein re: copyright and trademark matters. Inter-office conference with Wheeler re: organizational matters. Inter-office conferences with Gardner re: issuance of stock certificates, Fictitious Name Application.

02/23/99 C WHEELER .25 Review of correspondence re patent matters

02/24/99 G COLEMAN .25 Telephone conference with I. Newman.

02/25/99 C WHEELER .50 Arrange follow up on Jenex contract; receipt and review of MacKenzie contract

02/25/99 M ROBBINS 1.75 Review Financial Consulting Agreement. Revisions to Financial Consulting Agreement. Inter-office conferences with Coleman re: revisions to Financial Consulting Agreement. Inter-office conferences with Coleman re: revisions to Financial Consulting Agreement.

VIEWIT DOES NOT ATTEST TO THE AUTHENTICITY OF THESE BILLING RECORDS AND CITES THEM AS FRAUDULENT

CLIENT: IVIEWIT CORPORATION
MATTER: GENERAL CORPORATE ADVICE
PAGE: 6

June 18, 1999

03/09/99 G COLEMAN 1.50 Preparation of revised MacKenzie Agreement.
Preparation of correspondence to E. Bernstein
re: MacKenzie Agreement.

03/12/99 M ROBBINS .50 Review Mackenzie consulting agreement.
Telephone conferences with Coleman re: same.

03/16/99 C WHEELER 1.00 Call to Mr. Bernstein; conf with Mr. Lewin;
check status of trademark and copyright;

03/16/99 M ROBBINS .50 Inter-office conference with Wheeler re:
intellectual property matters.

03/23/99 A GORTZ .25 Simon & Eliot conf call; conf CCW.

03/23/99 C WHEELER .50 Conf with Mr. Berstein re private placement
over the Internet and re copyright follow up

03/24/99 C WHEELER .50 Conf as to private placement

03/24/99 C WHEELER .50 Call to Mr. Lewin; conf with Mr. Healey re
copyright; conf with patent counsel

03/26/99 C WHEELER .75 Call to Mr. Lewin; call to Mr. Bernstein; conf
with Mr. Bernstein

03/29/99 C WHEELER 1.00 Call to Mr. Lewin; conf with Mr. Bernstein;
conf with Mr. Healy; review of E-Mail relating
to status

03/29/99 K HEALY 1.25 Tc w/C. Wheeler; tcs w/Eliot Bernstein re
intellectual property protections; tc w/Raymond
Joao re patent pending; tcs w/E. Bernstein and
Jerry Levin re license business models; review
protectability of web-sites

03/30/99 B SCHIFF .25 Fixed Fee. Trademark Scan for I VIEW IT for
enhanced digital images.

03/30/99 K HEALY .50 FIXED FEE: Preliminary search Iviewit

03/30/99 K HEALY 1.00 Tc w/E. Bernstein and J. Levin re licensing
structures for Iviewit; tc w/C. Wheeler

03/31/99 K HEALY .25 Tc w/K. Rubenstein re Patent advice

04/01/99 C WHEELER .25 Conf with Mr. Gortz re status

04/02/99 C WHEELER 1.00 Conf with Mr. Kafin; conf with Mr Lewin re
meeting; conf with Mr. Lewin re staffing and
confidentiality agreement

Proskauer bills for and tells Iviewit they are filing copyrights for the source codes and buisness plan and website IP info. They never complete or have records of any of the work they bill for.



IVIEWIT DOES NOT ATTEST TO THE AUTHENTICITY OF THESE BILLING RECORDS AND CITES THEM AS FRAUDULENT

CLIENT: IVIEWIT CORPORATION

June 18, 1999


MATTER: GENERAL CORPORATE ADVICE

PAGE: 15

05/20/99 D THOMPSON II 1.25 Coordinate stock issuances.

05/20/99 D THOMPSON II 3.50 Coordinate Confidentiality Agreements and Product Evaluation Agreement.

05/20/99 C WHEELER .75 Conf with Mr. Joao


05/20/99 C WHEELER 2.00 Call to Mr. Lewin; conf with Ken Rubenstein; conf with Mara Lerner; numerous conf with Elliot Bernstein 

05/20/99 C WHEELER 1.00 Conf with Mr. Joao

05/20/99 K HEALY 1.50 Review web-site; tc w/Eliot Bernstein and Mara Lerner Robbins re review of web-site

05/20/99 M ROBBINS 6.50 Telephone conference call with E. Bernstein and K. Healy. Telephone conference call with E. Bernstein and C. Wolf. Telephone conferences with E. Bernstein re: website review. Review Iviewit website. Telephone conference call with Thompson and E. Bernstein re: License Evaluation Agreement. Preparation of License Evaluation Agreement. Inter-office conferences with Zammass re: letter agreements to issue shares. Preparation of packages to shareholders. Draft and preparation of Subscription Letter Agreement re: issuance of promissory note. Telephone call to Lewin re: Note terms. Review License Evaluation Agreement. Computer research re: license evaluation agreements. Telephone conference with Court re: License Evaluation Agreement. Inter-office conferences with Thompson re; License Evaluation Agreement. Organization of Iviewit file.

05/20/99 J ZAMMAS 3.50 Send electronic filing of Articles of Amendment to the Secretary of State; telephone Secretary of State to see that Amendment had been filed; preparation of letters to shareholders.

05/21/99 D THOMPSON II 1.25 Prepare Confidentiality Agreement with Huizenga Holdings; Telephone conference with counsel for Huizenga re same; Conference with Attorney C. Wheeler re Real 3D Confidentiality Agreement. 

05/21/99 D THOMPSON II 1.75 Telephone conference with Jerry Lewin re outstanding issues and projects; Follow-up re same; Telephone conference with Jerry Wacks re Tender's Agreement.

VIEWIT DOES NOT ATTEST TO THE AUTHENTICITY OF THESE BILLING RECORDS AND CITES THEM AS FRAUDULENT

CLIENT: IVIEWIT CORPORATION
MATTER: GENERAL CORPORATE ADVICE
PAGE: 18

June 18, 1999

05/27/99 C WHEELER .50 Conf with Mr. Rubenstein
05/27/99 C WHEELER 1.00 Arrange for additional confidentiality agreements;
05/27/99 C WHEELER 1.50 Overview of Iviewit patent matters and corporate matters
05/27/99 K HEALY .25 FIXED FEE: Cover letter and duplicate set of TM Apps to E. Bernstein
05/27/99 J ZAMMAS 2.00 Issue shares of Class B Common Stock; prepare stock ledger; send stock certificates and checks from shareholders to Eliot Bernstein for execution and return.
05/28/99 D THOMPSON II 1.25 Conference with Attorney C. Wheeler re patents and confidentiality agreements; assist re same.
05/28/99 C WHEELER .25 Conf as to additional Huizinga appointment
05/28/99 C WHEELER .50 Confirmation on Joao meeting
05/28/99 C WHEELER 3.00 Meeting with Huizinga group; conf with Mr. Healy re assignment; review of confidentiality agreements
05/28/99 C WHEELER 2.00 Meeting as to patent issues and management matters
05/28/99 C WHEELER .50 Conf. w/K.Rubenstein
05/28/99 K HEALY .50 Tcs w/C. Wheeler re IP Issues; review web-site
05/31/99 C WHEELER 1.00 Review of patent and other materials

SUMMARY OF HOURS

NAME	HOURS
ALBERT W. GORTZ	2.00
CHRISTOPHER WOLF	1.75
CHRISTOPHER C. WHEELER	76.25
RICHARD H. ROWE	2.00
TOTAL FOR PARTNER	82.00
ABRAHAM GUTWEIN	1.00
DONALD E. THOMPSON II	36.50
KEVIN J. HEALY	13.25
TOTAL FOR SENIOR COUNSEL	50.75

IVIEWIT DOES NOT ATTEST TO THE AUTHENTICITY OF THESE BILLING RECORDS AND CITES THEM AS FRAUDULENT

No such company exists?

CLIENT: IVIEWIT CORPORATION
MATTER: GENERAL CORPORATE ADVICE
PAGE: 2

August 24, 1999

Very strange how 12/98 billing appears here.

DATE	NAME	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
12/09/98	C WHEELER	2.00	Meeting as to corporate setup and new product
06/01/99	I AKSELRAD	.50	Tel w/CW & JL re tax structure
06/01/99	A GORTZ	.25	Cf CCW
06/01/99	D THOMPSON II	.25	Conference with Attorney Mara Lerner Robbins re employment agreement issues.
06/01/99	C WHEELER	4.00	Conf with Mr. Rubenstein; conf with Mr. Lewin; conf with Mr. Healy; conf with Mr. Joao; conf with Mr. Akselrod re patents, tax ramifications, <u>copyright work</u> ;
06/01/99	K HEALY	1.50	Conference call w/E. Bernstein, R. Joao, K. Rubenstein, C. Wheeler, and others re <u>iviewit I.P. issues</u> ; review cd.rom
06/01/99	M ROBBINS	.50	Inter-office conferences with Zamas re: received Subscription Letter Agreements (Notes) and Letter Agreements (Common Stock). Inter-office conference with Wheeler re: retention of Letter Agreements (Notes). Inter-office conferences with Thompson re: employment agreements.
06/01/99	J ZAMMAS	1.00	Preparation of letter to Eliot Bernstein regarding Subscription Letter Agreements; issue shares of iviewit.com, Inc. to iviewit, Inc.;
06/02/99	R ROWE	.25	Rev. finders issue
06/02/99	D THOMPSON II	.75	Correspondence re Finder's Fees Agreement with Attorney Gayle Coleman; Telephone conference re employment agreement issues.
06/02/99	C WHEELER	1.50	Lengthy conference with Mr. Bernstein and Mr. Lewin
06/02/99	K HEALY	.25	FIXED FEE: Review Confidentiality Agmt.
06/02/99	G COLEMAN	2.00	Draft and preparation of employment agreement. Telephone conference with E. Bernstein re McKenzie agreement.

IVIEWIT DOES NOT ATTEST TO THE AUTHENTICITY OF THESE BILLING RECORDS AND CITES THEM AS FRAUDULENT

CLIENT: IVIEWIT CORPORATION
MATTER: GENERAL CORPORATE ADVICE
PAGE: 7

August 24, 1999

e-mail to Thompson re: additional investors and new corporate structure. Telephone conference with Lewin and Bernstein re: promissory notes. Inter-office conference with Zammass re: e-mailing promissory notes. Review and revise list of note subscribers. Inter-office conference with Zammass re: revision to list of note subscribers.

06/15/99 J ZAMMAS 1.25 Preparation of Note and Subscription Letter Agreement for Lisa Sue Friedstein; send via overnight mail; e-mail Notes to Noteholders

06/16/99 D THOMPSON II 2.75 Finalize LLC Agreement; Telephone conference with Spencer Romoff, Jerry Lewin and Mara Lerner; Follow-up re implementation of same.

06/16/99 C WHEELER 4.00 Meeting with Mr. Joao and Messrs. Bernstein re patent and other matters

06/16/99 S ROMOFF 2.25 Telephone conference w/ DT and G. Lewin; Revise LLC Agreement and send draft G. Lewin; Research basis in patent.

06/16/99 M ROBBINS 2.00 Inter-office conferences with Thompson re: new iviewit structure, formation of new iviewit company, LLC Agreements and subscription agreements. Telephone conferences with Bernstein re: employment agreement. Telephone conference with Thompson, Lewin, Romoff re: new iviewit structure. Inter-office conferences with Zammass re: preparation of Certificate of Incorporation. Review Articles of Amendment to Articles of Incorporation of iviewit, Inc. Preparation of e-mail to Armstrong re: promissory note.

06/16/99 J ZAMMAS 1.00 E-mail documents to Noteholders; update Noteholder list; obtain Delaware forms for new incorporation.

06/17/99 C WHEELER .50 Call to Mr. Kohner of Arthur Anderson; call to Ken Rubenstein ←

06/17/99 C WHEELER .50 Follow up on Rossman and O'Donnell disclosures

06/17/99 C WHEELER 2.50 Meeting with Mr. Selman, Mr. Bernstein, Mr. Lewin


06/17/99 S ROMOFF .25 Conference w/ M. Robbins; Send model Single Member LLC to M. Robbins.

IVIEWIT DOES NOT ATTEST TO THE AUTHENTICITY OF THESE BILLING RECORDS AND CITES THEM AS FRAUDULENT

CLIENT: IVIEWIT.COM LLC
MATTER: GENERAL CORPORATE ADVICE
PAGE: 5

Rubenstein for Huizenga
meeting.

October 12, 1999

09/10/99 C WHEELER 2.00 Conf with Mr. Brandon; conf with Mr. Brandon;
 conf with Mr. Rubenstein; transmittal of
materials to Mr. Rubenstein; Call to Mr. Joao


09/10/99 K HEALY 1.00 Review iviewit files for materials requested
for E. Bernstein and B. Utley; tcs w/B. Schiff
re TM files

09/10/99 M ROBBINS 3.50 Draft and preparation of correspondence to
Utley, E. Bernstein and S. Bernstein re:
trademark searches. Telephone conferences with
C. Bernstein re: Certificate of Amendment and
Donna Dietz subscription agreement. Review
file re: received Acknowledgment Agreement from
Andrew Dietz. Preparation of e-mails to Zammas
re: follow-up matters. Review correspondence
from Lewin re: additional loan money from
Dietz, Armstrong, Friedstein. Telephone
conferences with Lewin re: same. Preparation
of list of notes. Organization of corporate
files.

09/13/99 C WHEELER 1.00 Conf with Mr. Brandon; conf with Mr. Joao;

09/13/99 C WHEELER 1.00 Review of correspondence

09/13/99 M ROBBINS 3.00 Inter-office conferences with Zammas re:
iviewit LLC schedule to LLC Agreement, Shirajee
and Rosario letters, Acknowledgment Agreements.
Telephone conferences with E. Bernstein re:
trademark matters, Acknowledgment Agreements.
Preparation of memo to Healy re: new trademark
search. Review correspondence from Lewin re:
additional loan money. Telephone conferences
with E. Bernstein re: Certificate of Amendment.
Telephone conference to Utley re: Certificate
of Amendment.

09/13/99 J ZAMMAS 1.25 Discuss patents with C. Wheeler's secretary;
 send another copy of the subscription letter
agreement for iviewit.com LLC to Andy Dietz;
send Acknowledgment Agreements to Andy Dietz;
insert corrected pages in iviewit LLC
Agreement.

09/14/99 C WHEELER 1.00 Call to Mr. Utley; Conf with Mr. Si Bernstein

09/15/99 A GORTZ .25 Cfs CCW


09/15/99 C WHEELER 1.00 Follow up on revisions to employment contract

IVIEWIT DOES NOT ATTEST TO THE AUTHENTICITY OF THESE BILLING RECORDS AND CITES THEM AS FRAUDULENT

CLIENT: IVIEWIT.COM LLC
MATTER: GENERAL CORPORATE ADVICE
PAGE: 5

Rubenstein for Huizenga
meeting.

October 12, 1999

09/10/99 C WHEELER 2.00 Conf with Mr. Brandon; conf with Mr. Brandon;
 conf with Mr. Rubenstein; transmittal of
materials to Mr. Rubenstein; Call to Mr. Joao


09/10/99 K HEALY 1.00 Review iviewit files for materials requested
for E. Bernstein and B. Utley; tcs w/B. Schiff
re TM files

09/10/99 M ROBBINS 3.50 Draft and preparation of correspondence to
Utley, E. Bernstein and S. Bernstein re:
trademark searches. Telephone conferences with
C. Bernstein re: Certificate of Amendment and
Donna Dietz subscription agreement. Review
file re: received Acknowledgment Agreement from
Andrew Dietz. Preparation of e-mails to Zammas
re: follow-up matters. Review correspondence
from Lewin re: additional loan money from
Dietz, Armstrong, Friedstein. Telephone
conferences with Lewin re: same. Preparation
of list of notes. Organization of corporate
files.

09/13/99 C WHEELER 1.00 Conf with Mr. Brandon; conf with Mr. Joao;

09/13/99 C WHEELER 1.00 Review of correspondence

09/13/99 M ROBBINS 3.00 Inter-office conferences with Zammas re:
iviewit LLC schedule to LLC Agreement, Shirajee
and Rosario letters, Acknowledgment Agreements.
Telephone conferences with E. Bernstein re:
trademark matters, Acknowledgment Agreements.
Preparation of memo to Healy re: new trademark
search. Review correspondence from Lewin re:
additional loan money. Telephone conferences
with E. Bernstein re: Certificate of Amendment.
Telephone conference to Utley re: Certificate
of Amendment.

09/13/99 J ZAMMAS 1.25 Discuss patents with C. Wheeler's secretary;
 send another copy of the subscription letter
agreement for iviewit.com LLC to Andy Dietz;
send Acknowledgment Agreements to Andy Dietz;
insert corrected pages in iviewit LLC
Agreement.

09/14/99 C WHEELER 1.00 Call to Mr. Utley; Conf with Mr. Si Bernstein

09/15/99 A GORTZ .25 Cfs CCW

09/15/99 C WHEELER 1.00 Follow up on revisions to employment contract

VIEWIT DOES NOT ATTEST TO THE AUTHENTICITY OF THESE BILLING RECORDS AND CITES THEM AS FRAUDULENT

CLIENT: IVIEWIT.COM, INC.
MATTER: GENERAL CORPORATE ADVICE
PAGE: 12

February 17, 2000

01/13/00 G COLEMAN 8.25 Multiple telephone conferences with Martha re: missing information for \$500,000 private offering memorandum. Meeting with B. Utley re: private offering memorandum and Investech. Meeting with E. Bernstein re: private offering memorandum. Multiple office conferences with E. Lewin re: restructure, private offering memorandum, and financial information. Multiple office conferences with M. Robbins re: due diligence. Study and Revise private offering memorandum. Preparation of duplicate offering memorandum re: Investech. Prepare summary of restructure. Telephone conference with G. Lewin re: share ownership. Preparation of memo to B. Utley. Preparation of analysis of corporate structure. Review and revise letter to Bell re: due diligence. Assist in due diligence response.

01/13/00 J ZAMMAS 4.25 Work on compiling due diligence documents; fax name-change amendment of iviewit Holdings, Inc. to the Florida Secretary of State; update stockholder/member lists.

01/14/00 D THOMPSON II 2.25 Meeting with Brian Utley and Jerry Lewin re Alpine deal, PPM and securities issues; Follow-up re same.

01/14/00 D THOMPSON II .75 Conference and analysis with Attorneys C. Wheeler and G. Coleman re securities and technology issues.

01/14/00 C WHEELER 2.00 Meeting with Mr. Utley and Mr. Bernstein; conf with Mr. Thompson

01/14/00 C WHEELER 1.00 Conf with Mr. Utley and Mr. Rubenstein

01/14/00 C WHEELER 1.00 Review of corporate setup; conf with Mr. Lewin

01/14/00 M ROBBINS 6.25 Telephone conference with Rodney Bell re: due diligence materials. Meetings with E. Lewin re: additional due diligence items. Telephone conferences with Maurice Buchsbaum and Eliot Bernstein re: business plan. Inter-office conference with Gayle Coleman re: private offering memorandum, revisions to offering memorandum re: risk factors for potential infringement and business plan. Review annotated due diligence list and conferences

IVIEWIT DOES NOT ATTEST TO THE AUTHENTICITY OF THESE BILLING RECORDS AND CITES THEM AS FRAUDULENT

CLIENT: IVIEWIT.COM, INC.
 MATTER: GENERAL CORPORATE ADVICE
 PAGE: 2

June 30, 2000

DATE	NAME	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
05/01/00	A GORTZ	.10	Ken Rubenstein call
05/01/00	D THOMPSON II	.75	Conference with Attorney Mara Lerner Robbins re pending projects and 100-for-1 split procedure and potential stock issues.
05/01/00	M ROBBINS	2.25	Preparation of revisions to board consent, stockholder consent and notice of written action regarding stock option plan. Revise pending matters list. Meeting with Rocky Thompson re: stock option plan, certificate of designation and other pending matters. Telephone conferences with G. Iantoni and S. Bernstein. Inter-office conference with Rocky Thompson re: potential new investor and control issues. Review Certificate of Designations re: stock option matters and stock split. Telephone conference with S. Bernstein.
05/01/00	J ZAMMAS	1.50	Work on Consents and Notice to Shareholders for M. Robbins; review documents sent to me by Martha at iviewit; make copies of Notes; preparation of memorandum to Martha.
05/01/00	A LEVY	2.00	Review and comment on No-Disclosure Agreements; meeting with B. Utley.
05/02/00	D THOMPSON II	.75	Review stock option plan materials; Conference with Attorney Mara Lerner Robbins.
05/02/00	C WHEELER	.25	Conf as to transfer of Joa files
05/02/00	M ROBBINS	3.50	Preparation of e-mail to K. Healy re: trademark and tag line registration. Review Delaware law re: forward stock split. Preparation of Certificate of Amendment to Certificate of Incorporation re: stock split. Preparation of written consent re: stock split. Preparation of e-mail to New York office re: trademark follow-up. Review Certificate of Designation re: forward stock split. Telephone conference with S. Bernstein re: admission of new investor and control issues. Review correspondence from B. UTely. Telephone conference with G. Iantoni. Telephone conference with B. Utley.

VIEWIT DOES NOT ATTEST TO THE AUTHENTICITY OF THESE BILLING RECORDS AND CITES THEM AS FRAUDULENT

CLIENT: IVIEWIT.COM, INC.
MATTER: GENERAL CORPORATE ADVICE
PAGE: 2

November 30, 2000

DATE	NAME	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
10/02/00	C WHEELER	.50	Follow up on conference call; call to Mr. Prolow
10/03/00	C WHEELER	1.00	Conf with Mr. Utley; conf with Mr. Utley; call to Mr. Prolow
10/03/00	C WHEELER	2.00	Conf call with Mr. Applestein, Mr. Prolow, Mr. Utley, Mr. Hersh, et. al.; conf with Mr. Hersh
10/03/00	C WHEELER	.50	Conf with auditors
10/03/00	C WHEELER	.25	Set up conf with investors
10/03/00	M ROBBINS	.50	Telephone conference with M. Mantecon. Preparation of memo to file.
10/04/00	C WHEELER	2.00	Con with Mr. Utley; arrange transmittal of confidentiality agreement; call to Elliot Bernstein;
10/04/00	C WHEELER	.25	Review of audit opinion
10/04/00	J ZAMMAS	.75	Preparation of audit update letter; e-mail to NY office for approval; have executed; telephone Martha at iviewit re fax number for Brian Fox; fax and mail letter to Brian Fox at Arthur Andersen.
10/05/00	C WHEELER	2.50	Review of confidentiality agreement; Conf with Mr. Hersh; conf with Mr. Utley; conf with Mr. Buschbaum; arrange follow up with Mr. Lineberger
10/05/00	C WHEELER	.25	Conf with Mr. Levy re confidentiality agreement
10/06/00	C WHEELER	.75	Review of confidentiality agreement; arrange for transmittal; conf with Mr. Levy
10/06/00	A LEVY	1.50	Mtng with C. Wheeler re Confidentiality Agreement; review and revise.
10/09/00	J ZAMMAS	.50	Return call to Martha at iviewit regarding stock certificates.
10/10/00	A LEVY	1.00	Matters re Confidentiality Agreement; patent issues.
10/11/00	C WHEELER	1.50	Conf with Mr. Utley re Ken Rubenstein and Time Warner; conf with Mr. Rubenstein

Rubenstein opines to AOLTW/WB regarding efficacy of patents, see AOLTW letters



CLIENT: IVIEWIT.COM, INC.


November 30, 2000



VIEWIT DOES NOT ATTEST TO THE AUTHENTICITY OF THESE BILLING RECORDS AND CITES THEM AS FRAUDULENT

MATTER: GENERAL CORPORATE ADVICE
PAGE: 3

10/11/00 C WHEELER .50 Conf with Mr. Prolow
10/12/00 C WHEELER .50 Conf with Mr. Utley
10/12/00 C WHEELER .25 Conf with Mr. Utley
10/13/00 C WHEELER .50 Conf with Mr. Utley re investors and
confidentiality agreement
10/16/00 M ROBBINS .25 Inter-office conference with J. Zammas re:
outstanding warrants.
10/16/00 J ZAMMAS .25 Telephone call from Ray Hersch at iviewit;
e-mail stock ledger to him.
10/19/00 C WHEELER 1.25 Conf with Mr. Prolow re offer; conf with Mr.
Utley; conf with Mr. Utley; conf with Mr.
Prolow
10/23/00 C WHEELER .50 Conf with Mr. Prolow re proposed investor
10/23/00 C WHEELER .50 Conference w/B.Utley
10/26/00 C WHEELER 1.00 Conf with Mr. Prolow; conf with Mr. Utley; conf
with Mr. Reed re trademark and copyright
matters
10/31/00 C WHEELER .50 Conf with Mr. Utley; conf with Mr. Rubenstein;
Conf with Mr. Utley re financing





SUMMARY OF HOURS

NAME	HOURS
CHRISTOPHER C. WHEELER	17.00
TOTAL FOR PARTNER	17.00
ANDREW D. LEVY	2.50
MARA LERNER ROBBINS	.75
TOTAL FOR ASSOCIATE	3.25
JILL B. ZAMMAS	1.50
TOTAL FOR LEGAL ASSISTANT	1.50
TOTAL HOURS:	21.75

IVIEWIT DOES NOT ATTEST TO THE AUTHENTICITY OF THESE BILLING RECORDS AND CITES THEM AS FRAUDULENT

CLIENT: IVIEWIT.COM, INC.
 MATTER: GENERAL CORPORATE ADVICE
 PAGE: 2

December 6, 2000

DATE	NAME	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
11/01/00	C WHEELER	.25	Conf with Mr. Utley re financing and re Mr. Rubenstein 
11/03/00	C WHEELER	.50	Call to Mr. Utley; conf with Mr. Utley re funding;
11/03/00	C WHEELER	.50	Review of stock grant requests
11/05/00	C WHEELER	1.00	Conf with Mr. Utley; conf with Mr. Prolow re investors
11/06/00	C WHEELER	.50	Conf with Mr. Utley re investors
11/06/00	J ZAMMAS	.25	Discuss past due invoice with Mary at iviewit.
11/07/00	C WHEELER	.75	Conf with Mr. Utley re financing; call to Mr. Assaf; conf with Mr. Utley re Mr. Rubenstein 
11/08/00	J ZAMMAS	.50	Preparation of receipt for iviewit minute books to be loaned to company; compile minute books for pickup.
11/09/00	C WHEELER	.75	Conf with Mr. Utley re funding ; conf with Mr. Assaf re funds; call to Mr. Prolow
11/09/00	C WHEELER	.50	Conf with Mr. Prolow; conf with Mr. Utley
11/10/00	D THOMPSON II	.50	Telephone conference with Attorney C. Wheeler re bridge financing; Follow-up re same.
11/10/00	C WHEELER	.50	Conf with Mr. Utley re financing
11/13/00	D THOMPSON II	1.25	Conference with Attorney Mara Lerner Robbins; review promissory note; Meeting with Brian Utley.
11/13/00	C WHEELER	.25	Report on Alpine financing
11/13/00	C WHEELER	.25	Report from Mr. Thompson on interim financing; transmittal to Mr. Thompson
11/13/00	M ROBBINS	1.00	Review demand note. Inter-office conference with Rocky Thompson re: demand note and convertible note. Review convertible note.
11/14/00	C WHEELER	.25	Check status of note